
NISEI ENEMY 
GETS JAIL TERM 

WALNUT GROVE-The courts, 
from the smallest to the highest, 
"must uphold the laws of our coun-
try," Justice of the Peace Milo E. 
Dye declared today as he sentenced 
Mrs. Wilma Insigne, alias "Kitty 
Ferguson," to ninety days in the 
Sacramento County jail for dis-
turbing the peace of a returning 
Japanese American family. 

It was the first jail sentence 
ordered for the threatening of 
Japanese Americans .who now are 
being permitted to come back to 
the west coast from War Reloca-
tion Authority (WRA) centers. 

Sixty days of the sentence was 
suspended provided that Mrs. In-
signe leaves the county for one 
year after she serve thirty days. 

The complaint was filed by Army 
Pvt. Y oshio Matsuoka, who spent 
ten months in a German prison 
camp and recently met his family 
at a Colorado relocation center. He 
stated that Mrs. Insigne threaten-
ed to have his father's home burned 
do ;vn if the famil · 
Walnut Grove. 


